
Public Notice 

 
 

CHANGE IN THE MEANS OF PRESENTATION OF THE BOROUGH COUNCIL 
MEETINGS – ONLINE SESSIONS 

 
SPECIAL BOROUGH COUNCIL MEETING ON THE 2022 BUDGET AND THE 2022-

2031 TEN-YEAR CAPITAL WORKS PROGRAM 
5:30 P.M. ON DECEMBER 6, 2021 

 
REGULAR BOROUGH COUNCIL MEETING  

7 P.M. ON DECEMBER 6, 2021 
 
NOTICE is hereby given that because of the increase in the number of COVID-19 cases, 
the Côte-des-Neiges–Notre-Dame-de-Grâce Borough Council will hold its meetings 
scheduled for December 6, 2021 online only. 
 
Consequently, and contrary to the notices published on November 28 and December 1, 
2021, no one may attend the meetings in person. 
 
The Council meetings will be streamed live on the borough website.  
 
Special Borough Council Meeting  – December 6, 2021 at 5:30 pm 
 
At the meeting, you will have the opportunity to ask questions or submit requests on any 
issue concerning the 2022 budget and the ten-year capital works program for 2022-2031 
(30-minute period). 
 
If you wish to ask a question on any issue concerning the 2022 budget or the ten-year 
capital works program for 2022-2031, you may submit your question on the 2022 budget 
and TYCWP - 5:30 pm - form available on the Côte-des-Neiges–Notre-Dame-de-Grâce 
borough website, in the Borough Council section (montreal.ca/en/cote-des-neiges-notre-
dame-de-grace), by noon on Monday, December 6, 2021. After this date, messages will 
not be read and questions submitted will not be eligible. Questions relating to a subject 
other than the budget or the ten-year capital works program will not be considered. 
 
 
Regular Borough Council Meeting – December 6, 2021 at 7:00 pm 
 
At the meeting, you will have the opportunity to ask questions or submit requests on any 
issue concerning your borough or the municipal administration (90-minute period).   
 
If you wish to ask a question on any issue concerning the borough or its administration, 
you may submit your question on the Regular Borough Council - 7:00 pm - form 
available online on the Côte-des-Neiges–Notre-Dame-de-Grâce borough website, in the 
Borough Council section (montreal.ca/en/cote-des-neiges-notre-dame-de-grace), by 
noon on Thursday, December 6, 2021. After this date, messages will not be read and 
questions submitted will not be eligible.  
 
The agenda for this meeting and the decision summary will be available as soon as 
possible, in French, in the Borough Council section of the Côte-des-Neiges–Notre-
Dame-de-Grâce borough website (montreal.ca/en/cote-des-neiges-notre-dame-de-
grace). The English version of the agenda will be available on the borough website on 
the day of the meeting.  
 
Please note that the FINAL agenda is the one adopted by the municipal councillors at 
the beginning of each meeting 
 
GIVEN at Montréal, this December 3, 2021. 
 
 
 
Geneviève Reeves, avocate  
Secrétaire d’arrondissement 
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